
 

 

Liability Release Waiver 

In consideration of engaging Equitatio in consultation, equine training, or other activity in relation to your 
equine with or without financial remuneration. 
 
I, do hereby forever release, indemnify and hold harmless and discharge Equitatio, its members, owners 
and any and all land owners, horse owners, employees, volunteers, other participants, and if applicable, 
owners and lessors of premises and/or horses used to conduct training or an event (from here on known 
as OPERATORS), from any claims or suits for personal injury, property damage and/or theft (including 
any loss, injury and/or death to any livestock) which may occur while riding, training, observing or 
engaging in, any equine activity at any time or any place and/or for any injury/loss which may occur in 
connection with the use of or presence near any livestock, horse trailers, equipment and/or tack, 
(whether the OPERATOR’S, my own or a third party’s) and/or while using the premises including but not 
limited to the barn, stalls, riding areas, wash racks, paddocks, grounds, trails, and farmland.   
 
I understand that riding and handling equines is an inherently dangerous activity.  I understand that 
equines have the propensity, regardless of the equine’s training, temperament and/or history, to behave 
in ways that could result in injury, harm or death to the participant, spectators, other persons or the 
equine itself. I understand that no one can predict an equine’s reaction to sound, movement, objects, 
persons, machines or other animals. I understand that surface or subsurface conditions may be 
hazardous and that terrain defects may be latent or hidden, or open and obvious. I understand that 
equines are unpredictable and may, but not limited to, buck, bolt, spook, jump, bite and/or kick at any 
time without warning.  I understand these risks and voluntarily choose to encounter them and engage in 
and/or observe an equine activity.   
 
I understand that I am responsible for my own Personal Protective Equipment (PPE). PPE will be in line 
with current safety standards. If the PPE is found unacceptable, then the OPERATORS reserve the right 
to exclude me from the activity with no recourse or right to a refund. 
 
I hereby declare that I am medically fit and can participate in chosen activities. All medical conditions 
have been disclosed, including what they are, how they affect me and potentially, the chosen activity. 
 
I hereby declare that the equine(s) at an event, training, or under consultation with the OPERATORS are 
adequately insured with a minimum of £5 million third-party indemnity claim coverage. 
 
I understand that refunds will consider time, travel, equipment, and hire charges. A full refund may not be 
appropriate and is at the discretion of the OPERATORS. 
 
I understand that the desired training outcome might take longer than anticipated. Stopping before 
achieving the desired outcome does not give ground for a refund claim. 
 
The undersigned declares and represents that no promise, inducement or agreement not herein 
expressed has been made to the undersigned and that this document contains the entire agreement 
between the parties hereto.   
 
Signature:        Date:     

 

 

Emergency Contact 
 

Name: 

Telephone: 

Relation:  


